

1:49



zanbato



Cancel



Zanbato Finance

★★★★★ 9



**Live Orders**

Value	Price	Offers	Value
\$400K	\$100.00	\$105.00	\$5M

\$25 - \$100M ITW

**Historical prices (past 4 quarters)**

**Funding Rounds (as of 02/23/2017)**

Preferred Stock B 10/23/2017

price / share \$1.79

by multiple 1x

shares authorized 2,200,000,000

**Documents**

View certificate of incorporation

**Latest News**

10/23/2017  
Airbnb asks SEC for equity for hosts

**ZX Market Overview**

Search by company name

Name

ALL BY WATCHLIST

Zanbato	\$175.36	\$4.25
Zanbato	no bid	\$4.25
Zanbato	\$1.16	\$10.90
Zanbato	\$5.50	no offer
Zanbato	no bid	\$7.00
Zanbato	no bid	\$5.34
Zanbato	no bid	\$5.34
Zanbato	no bid	\$5.34
Zanbato	no bid	\$5.34
Zanbato	no bid	\$5.34



Today



Games



Apps



Arcade



Search