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List of Services 
 
Class 35: 
compiling of information into computer databases; provision of information concerning 
commercial sales; Business consulting services; Business management planning. 
 
Class 42: 
creation of internet web sites; web site hosting services; New product design services; 
industrial design services; packaging design services; innovation consulting services in 
the field of the heating and cooling systems, automotive equipment, escalators, elevators, 
electrical hand driers, power generation systems, electrical transmission and 
distribution systems, semiconductor and semiconductor devices, electrical display 
screens and electrical display monitors, satellite components, GPS equipment, power 
supplies, superconductor systems, doppler lidar systems, microwave tubes, railway 
equipment, home appliances, fans, water pumps, vacuum cleaners, electronic goods, 
artificial intelligence, industrial robots, humanoid robots with artificial intelligence, 
driverless cars and medical apparatus; research and development services relating to 
the heating and cooling systems, automotive equipment, escalators, elevators, electrical 
hand driers, power generation systems, electrical transmission and distribution systems, 
semiconductor and semiconductor devices, electrical display screens and electrical 
display monitors, satellite components, GPS equipment, power supplies, superconductor 
systems, doppler lidar systems, microwave tubes, railway equipment, home appliances, 
fans, water pumps, vacuum cleaners, electronic goods, artificial intelligence , industrial 
robots, humanoid robots with artificial intelligence, driverless cars and medical 
apparatus; research and design services relating to the heating and cooling systems, 
automotive equipment, escalators, elevators, electrical hand driers, power generation 
systems, electrical transmission and distribution systems, semiconductor and 
semiconductor devices, electrical display screens and electrical display monitors, 
satellite components, GPS equipment, power supplies, superconductor systems, doppler 
lidar systems, microwave tubes, railway equipment, home appliances, fans, water pumps, 
vacuum cleaners, electronic goods, artificial intelligence , industrial robots, humanoid 
robots with artificial intelligence, driverless cars and medical apparatus; industrial 
analysis and research services relating to the heating and cooling systems, automotive 
equipment, escalators, elevators, electrical hand driers, power generation systems, 
electrical transmission and distribution systems, semiconductor and semiconductor 
devices, electrical display screens and electrical display monitors, satellite components, 
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GPS equipment, power supplies, superconductor systems, doppler lidar systems, 
microwave tubes, railway equipment, home appliances, fans, water pumps, vacuum 
cleaners, electronic goods, artificial intelligence , industrial robots, humanoid robots with 
artificial intelligence and  driverless cars; design and development of computer 
hardware and software; testing and research services relating to the heating and cooling 
systems, automotive equipment, escalators, elevators, electrical hand driers, power 
generation systems, electrical transmission and distribution systems, semiconductor and 
semiconductor devices, electrical display screens and electrical display monitors, 
satellite components, GPS equipment, power supplies, superconductor systems, doppler 
lidar systems, microwave tubes, railway equipment, home appliances, fans, water pumps, 
vacuum cleaners, electronic goods, artificial intelligence, industrial robots, humanoid 
robots with artificial intelligence, driverless cars and medical apparatus; medical 
research; research services relating to nursing care; research services relating to health. 
 
Class 43: 
Retirement homes; Booking of temporary accommodation via the Internet. 
 
Class 44: 
nursing care; Consulting services in the field of nursing; Rental of medical apparatus; 
telemedicine services; medical evaluation services; Providing medical information from 
a web site; managed health care services; Advisory services relating to health; nursing, 
medical; Geriatric nursing; Services rendered by a dietician. 
 


